HOW TO VIEW SOLICITATION EVENTS AND SUBMIT BIDS
County of Sonoma Supplier Portal

You must be registered in the County of Sonoma’s Supplier Portal in order to view completed solicitations, receive
emailed solicitation notifications, and submit bids. Register as a Bidder if your company has not done business with
the County of Sonoma in the past. If your company has previously done business with the County, register as a

Supplier.

The information contained in this document is a general overview and applies to solicitations for both goods and
services, including RFPs, RFQs, and RFls. Please note that our software and documentation refers to all submissions
as “bids.”

Navigate to the Supplier Portal and login using your User ID and password.

If you forgot your User ID or experience technical issues while viewing an event or submitting a bid, email our
Supplier Desk for prompt assistance.

¥ Sonoma County Supplier Portal

COUNTY OF
SONOMA

Sonoma County Portal

Welcome to Sonoma County's Supplier Portal page. This
different browser, please disable your pop-up blocker. SignIn x

Registration is required in order to review and bid on Coun

addenda. Instructional guides on how to register are avail UserID | djacksan

Desk.

Maint_enance changes are a[_:plled to this_ sit_e Tuesdays fr Password |""““"" -
expenience loss of functionality dunng this time.

] Enable Screen Reader Mode

O =

Forgot Password?

Wiew Reqistration Options.
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https://esupplier.sonomacounty.ca.gov/
https://esupplier.sonomacounty.ca.gov/SonomaPortalDocs/Training/BidderRegistrationInstructionsADA.pdf
https://esupplier.sonomacounty.ca.gov/SonomaPortalDocs/Training/SupplierRegistrationInstructionsADA.pdf
https://esupplier.sonomacounty.ca.gov/
mailto:supplier-desk@sonoma-county.org?subject=Assistance%20with%20Viewing/Submitting

Navigating the Supplier Portal

In order to view completed solicitations, receive emailed solicitation notifications, and submit bids select the tile
on the Supplier Portal landing page that states Click Here to Begin.

' Sonoma County Supplier Portal

Instructional Documents Click Here to Begin

How to View a Solicitation and Submit a Bid

Suppler Account Management Instructions

To view the documents linked above, you must have Adobe Reader, ar
comparable application, to view PDF's. Additional instructions can be found in
the FAQs section of this portal. Click the “Click Here to Begin® tile on the right
to access. Please email supplier-dask@sonoma-county_org if you experience
difficulties using this site.

Search for a Solicitation Event

In the left navigation pane, click Bidding Activities to open the folder, then choose View Events and Place Bids.
Public solicitation events will appear in the web panel on the right. To narrow results, use the Search Criteria
filters. Click on the link for the solicitation event you want to view. You will be taken to the Event Details page for
your selected event.

£ Sonoma County Supplier Portal Supplier Portal Nav Collection
| Bidding Activities -
View Events and Place Bids Welcome. EFS Support Organizab
Lser
View Events and Place Bids Enter search critena to lcate an event for viewng of placing bids
1 naaintain User Account ¥ | = Sgarch Criteria
T Change My Password Use Saved Search =
T Wiew Terms & Conditions Resultz Should Include:
Event
D P Sell Event
' FAQs | Contact Us Event Name M Purchase Event
Event Typa = M Request For Infarmatisn
Event Status )
B Include Declined Invitations?
Search I Clear Criteria
n-]anagc Saved Searches Save Search Cntena Advanced Search Critena
Search Results
=
Event D Event Nama Fornmat Typa Enel Date
SCO01-0000000867 E‘;fi‘g:ﬁ‘ag“ Water and Landill Gas sel RFx 052412019 1200 FM FOT
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Accept Invitation

Please select Accept Invitation button. This will place your firm on our bidders list, and you will receive
notifications of any addenda or changes. You will then be returned to the previous step on View Events and Place

Bids screen.

Event Details

nformation On Inguiry Options

Accept Invitation I

View Docs/Submit Bid

Event Name

Event ID

Event Format/ Type
Event Round
Event Version
Event Start Date
Event End Date

Test Event for Portal Improvements 3

SC001-0000001129

Sell Event RFx
1

1

08242020 10:36AM PDT
08/24/2021 10:36 AM POT

View a Solicitation Event

Welcome, Purchasing Validation
User: purchasing

View Event Activity

In order to view the entire solicitation and download documentation, click View Docs/Submit Bid.
This does not obligate you to bid, but will allow you to view the event and its documentation.

Event Details

Imfarmation Cn Inquiry Options

l View Docs/Submit Bid

Event Name

Event ID

Event Format/Type
Event Round
Evant Version
Event Start Date

Event End Date

Event Description:

Contact
Phone

Email

Updated: 09/23/2020

Test Event 4 for Supplier Improvements
C001-0000001132

Sell Event RFx

1

1

08/26/2020 4:45FPN FOT
08282021 04:46 PMPOT

SC BuyeriTest

Email ID

Source: How to View Solicitations and Submit Bids

Payment Terms

My Bids

Edits to Submitted Bids
Multiple Bids

VWelcome, Supplier Fortal Impravements Test
User: ST TestBidder

Wiew Event Actiity
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The following screenshots are partial views of the Event Details page; scroll down on your computer to view all

event-related information.

Click Download/Upload Documents Here

Event Details

Submit Bid Save for Later
Event Name  Test Event 4 for Supplier Improvements
EventID SCO01-0000001132
Event Format/Type  Sall Event RFx

Event Round 1
Ewvent Version 1
Event Start Date  (08/25/2020 4-46PM PDT

Event End Date OR282021 04:45 PR POT

Dawnload/Upload Documents Here

Hide Additonal Event Info

Bidding Instructions

BidID  New
Bid Date

Bid Currency LUSD

ame, Suppher Fortal Improvements Test)
SITTestBudder

Validate Entries

Click View to view and download solicitation documents. If these documents are a PDF, they will open in a new
tab. If they are a Word or Excel document, the download process will begin automatically. If the new tab, or the
download process do not happen, check and ensure that pop-up blockers in your web browser is turned off. When
ready to return to the Events Detail page, click OK at the bottom of the Event Comments and Attachment page.

Event Comments and Atiachments
Butingss Unft  SCO0 Erment 1D (0DODOCTED Event Roand
Aimsc henesis
biawr Evan Areschmania (7
il
ATICW P
T 16_COUNTY_CF_SONROMA_BID TESMS_AND_CONDNTIONS pat
How o Wi Seactations ang Ssbeml_BMs Rev C 20170201 pa
VI ATACTHTENES [
Dectaation_of_Loca Musiness S Goaods. pof
General_nosnaion_and_iequeed_oEa_Evesl 162 par
2N _COMPACT T PASSINGER WAN FOR_DHE o
Vefmoe_ TG Comgact_T_Fassenges Vin pal
fud R Alacanent
=
Aached Fily ittachment Desoripion Uptoad
upiaaa
[Fomments
Add Hew Commems L
| pﬂ; Carcel

Even| Varssen: 1

ARGERTAE Cescripacn

Tewms and Conatons

How 10 Ve andg Suba Bkt

O A0 SIS Bl ABSChmEnts

Dactardon of Locy Busarss

(el IMormalien 7 Requiral Data

Wetiche Spracalon

Ever] Dot

Wi Add how ARaChmests  Delde

e VWindlow

View

View

Viirw

View

Yiew

Viwe

View

Hep Spnonalin: Page
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Scroll down to view the rest of the event. To save your bid for later review, click Save for Later. If you want to

place a bid now, continue with these instructions.

Lines
5 Q
- . = Requestad YourBid Your Unit Bid
Line Description Unit Quantity Quantity Price
BID - 2015 MODEL YEAR COMPACT
7 PASSENGER VAN PER EA 1.0000 1.0000 0.000000

ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS.
COLOR: LIGHT GREEN METALLIC

No Bid

1-1 of 4%

Your Total Bid Price

0.0000 USD

At any point in the bid response process you may save an in-progress bid and resume completion at ater ime. When your bid response is complete, submit for consideration

Submit Bid Save for Later

How to Place a Bid

To upload documents specified in the solicitation, click Download/Upload Documents Here.

Event Details

Submit Bid

Event Name

EventID

Event FormatType
Event Round
Event Version
Event Start Date

Event End Date

Save for Later

Test Event 4 for Supglier Imgrovements

SCRO1-0000001132
Sell Event

1

1

RFx

026/2020 4:48PM PDT
08262021 04 46 P FDT

Download/Upload Documents Here

Hide Additicnal Event Info

Bidding

BidID New
Bid Date

Bid Currency | USO

S Delar

tructions

Melcome, Su)

User: SITTestBid

Wiew Al

Bid

Validate Entries

ppbier Foral Improvements Test
dder

Validate Entries

To upload a single document, click Upload. If uploading multiple documents, click Upload for the first document.
For each additional document, click Add New Attachments, then Upload. You may add a description for each
document. Click OK when finished.
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Fovoribes = et b ™ Wanage Events ond Fiooe Sk ¥ ik Evants and Plasc Bk & Home | Sign Out

Mew Window | Help | Personalize Page | =

Event Comments and Attachments

Business Unit  SC001 EventiD 0000000763 Event Round: 1 Event Version: 1
Atachments

View Event Attachmenis (7

= -7 or 7|~
Attached File Attachment Description Viaw
7-6-16_COLUNTY_OF_SONOMA_BID_TERMS_AND_CONDITIONS paf Terms and Condifions View
Howr_to_View_Sobctations_and_Submil_Bids_Rev_C_20170201.pdf Haw to View and Submit Bids View
Wander_Attachments pot Hiyey 1o Submi Eid Aflachments View
Declaration_of Local BUsiness_for Goods.pat Declaration of Lecal Busingss View
General_information_and_required_cata_Event 762 pdf General Information and Reguired Dats View
2019_COMPACT_T_PASSENGER_VAN_FOR_DHS pof Vahick Speofications View
Vehicle_2019_Compaci_7_Passenger_\an.pdf Event Details View

Add Mew Attachments

b v} 1-2 of 2[+]
AtRChed Filg Attachment Descripdion Upload View
Complaled_Decdamabon_of_| ocal_Biusness_4MB pi Upl o View i Wi Attachments | Delete
Uploaad View Aiid New Attachments | Delete
Comamants

Add New Comments. (7

Use the dropdown menu to answer the question regarding acceptance of the County’s Terms and Conditions. Any
exceptions must be listed in your uploaded documentation and/or hard copy submittal.

Event Questions

# Bid Required & ldeal Response Required
1of2 »

General Questions
*
Do you accept Scncma County's Terms and Conditlons? Please list any exceptions.

Response 3-Yes M
*
Have you upleoaded 21l required documents?

Response Yes v
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Enter Pricing

Enter the quantity you are bidding on and your unit bid price for each line (see red box],
Click No Bid (see blue box) if you are not bidding on a particular line.

Note: If you are submitting a proposal for a RFP or RFQ, enter $.01 in the Unit Bid Price field when submitting your
bid and accompanying proposal. The County will evaluate the proposal based upon the actual costs shown in the
proposal itself.

# Bid Requirsd I;“\

Lines
= Q 11 of 1[¥] View All
. . = Requaested Your Bid Your Unit Bid - —

Ling Description Unit Quantity Quantity Price Mo Bid Your Totzl Bid Price

BID - 2019 MODEL YEAR COMPACT

7 PASSENGER VAN PER )
ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS EA 1.0000 1.0000 0.000000 mi 0.0000 USD Bid

COLOR LIGHT GREEM METALLIC

If there is a line for Shipping/Freight, enter 1 in the Bid Quantity field, and the total shipping/freight charge in the
Unit Bid Price field.

If there is no charge for Shipping/Freight, enter 0.00 in the Unit Bid Price field. Do not use the “No Bid” box or
change the bid quantity on the Shipping/Freight line, as errors will result.

After entering all pricing, confirm bid quantity and pricing (green boxes) and make any corrections. If prices are
correct, click Validate Entries. If you get an error message, fix the error and click Validate Entries again.

@Ii}:ﬁ
= Q 1-1erfv] Viigws All
- . - Requested Your Bid Your Unit Bid ; " 5
Line Description Unit Quantity Quantity Price No Bid Your Total Bid Price
BID - 2019 MODEL YEAR
COMPACT 7 PASSENGER VAN
1 PER ATTACHED EA 1.0000 1.0000 35690.000000 1 35,600.0000 LSD Bid

SPECIFICATIONS. COLOR: LIGHT

'GREEN METALUIC

AL Ay poink in the bid response Process Wou may Save an In-prodress bid and resums completon at later tmea. When your bid raspenze 5 completa, submit Tor considarstion.

Submit Bid Save for Later Validate Entries

Upon receiving a No Errors Found message, you may save your bid for later, or submit your bid now. The
submission process is not complete until Submit Bid is selected, and you receive onscreen and email confirmation.

An onscreen confirmation will immediately appear after your submission, however bid will not be reviewed for
accuracy or completeness until after close of event.

[
Bid Confirmation

Your bid will be reviewed for accuracy and completeness after close of the event.

BidID 1 Bid Date 08/27/2020 9:17-:00AM PDT
EventID 0000001132 Test Event 4 for Supplier Improvements
Event Format Sell Event Round 1 Version 1
Start Date 08/26/2020 4-46PM PDT End Date 08/26/2021}2.46 PM PDT

Your Total Price 37 500.00 USD
OK Copy Bid
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You will also receive an emailed confirmation.

Your Bid on a County of Sonoma Solicitation Has Been Received

To

Retzntion Palicy  Inbox (50 days) Expires  4/22/2013

B vour_Bid.pof .
A 15KB

Bid Notification

fully reviewed &s fo corecingss and completeness afler the solicitalion ends.

Ewvent ID: SC001 - 0000000763 Round 1 Werzion 1
Event Name: Vehicle 2010 Cempact 7 Paszengar Van
Bid 1D: 1

Date Posted: 02/21(19 9:35-17AM PST

‘You have submitted a bid on a County of Sonoma solicitation. This Motification is not a confirmation of the correctness or completeness of your bid submiszion. Your bid submission wil be

Retrieving a Saved Bid

If you previously saved a bid and did not submit it, follow the instruction in this section to continue the bid

process.

In the left navigation pane, click Bidding Activities to open the folder, then choose View Events and Place Bids. Your

saved, not-submitted bid should appear. Click on View/Edit.

@h Resubts

[y Lvestt Mere Fomat Tive Lmlini- b
SCO01-0000000T 62 Veatichs 201 Conpact T Fasserger Van Sel RFx GG G131 P PET ¥ Suited
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SO 00000 ) pid ey Spd RFx NI OO O P PEIT

P p—— FEFP - Eet winut ol Bedoga Bay ot s e
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Wet Subaine VLA

ViewEdt
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Shats
Aceped Dricus "
Azrapnd Do

You will be returned to the Event Details page. Edit your bid, following the same process outlined in the How to

Place a Bid section.

Event Details

Guattrre Bl o for Laler

ikl ko
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HCO0100000758 mam 1
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Once you have finished entering your bid, Validate Entries. Save for Later, or Submit Bid now.

Lines
S QO 1-10i1[¥ View Al
) o _ Requested Your Bid Your Unit Bid - i
Line Description Unit Quantity Quantity Price No Bid Your Total Bid Price
Enter §.07 In the Unit EId Frice
field when submitfing your bid and
Sjeccpmmpenn pace: d=A3T e EA 1.0000 1.0000 0010000 O 0.0000 LISD Bid

County will evaluale based upon
the actual costs shownin the
proposal.

At any point in the bid response process you may 5ave an in-progress bid and rasuma comglation af later fima. Whan your bid respense is complete, submit for consideration.

l Submit Bid |

Save for Later |

Validate Entries

Editing a Submitted Bid

In the left navigation pane, click Bidding Activities to open the folder, then choose View Events and Place Bids. Your

submitted bid should appear. Click on View/Edit.

Search Results

= raumsF
Event D Lvert ke Fomat e Ena Do St Mot Suraios VPSS Sty

FLO1 Q00T G WVihich 2018 Conpact T Passenger Van 0l RFx CRTI0E GO PM PET 1 Subenited ViewEdn Acieped Ducus
SO mg’z‘"m S sul RPx NN 00 P POIT 1 Savet ViewE Aeraped hens
P e—— FUFP - ot Vorus of Bedega By Bt it [ s

You will be returned to the Event Details page. Edit your bid, following the same process outlined in the How to

Place a Bid section.

Event Details

Retract Bi

Bicding Inshrudlions:

Weaicome, TEST
User: SCAIDOEATESTUAT00

Validaie Enfries

Evont Hame  Vetick 2019 Compact T Passangar Van
EventiD  SCOM-0000000763 EdiD 1
Event FarmatType  Sell Event RFx Bid Dt (010 $:35:47AM PET
Event Round 1 B Comeney USD g poter
Event Verdion 1
Event Start Dele 110772018 110048 F3T
Event End Dale CETTR0E 031 PM PST
Vel Ginaral Comments and Attictments
Hise A anal Event info
Descriplion: _
Sonoma Counly is scliding bids for 2019 MODEL YEAR COMPACT 7 PASSENGER VAN COLOR: LIGHT GREEN METALLIC AL

Al Spacications ane lncsed In tha Supplier Fortal™

Pleaze Log imo fre Supples Porial ot hifps fesupplien sonomacounty. co.govipep FRPRIVELIPPLIER/ERPMASb=DEFALILT be Visw Ful even incheding Bid
Solckaton, Spacifcations and Aflachments

Piry ezt Tesrms

Comacl  Brenda Haas

Phvone Billing Locstion  EFS TEAM
Email Emsl D Evenl Culency  Doilar
Omlling Misciseion DEnss Bvntin Foum Comversion Bate 100000000
Edits io Submitied Bids  Apaywad
Multiple Bids  Allewsed

Step 1 Answer General Event Questions

The =vent administralor requests your respane=e bo questons not spechic o any specric dem

General Evant Guestions 1
Reguined Queslions 1
Questions Responsed To 1

Hide Evenl Cassiiong
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To submit your edited bid, Validate Entries first and then select Update Submitted Bid. If you select Retract Bid
now, your edited bid will not be resubmitted, and will be in an incomplete, saved status.

Lines
> Q 11a 1] Vigal Al
. - Requested Your Bid Your Unit Bid . -

Line Description Unit Cuantity Quantity Price No Bid Your Tolal Bid Price

BI - 2019 MODEL YEAR
COMPACT 7 PASSENGER VAN
1 PER ATTACHED EA 1.0000 10000 35600000000 O 35,690, 0000 USD Bid
GPECIFICATIONS. COLOR: LIGHT
GREEM METALLIC

At any poirt i e bid responss process yoll May S&VE &N in-prooress bid and resume completion at later time. When your bid responze is comglete, submat for conzideration.

Update Submitied Bid Retract Bid WValidiate Entries

After submitting your updated bid, you will receive an onscreen Bid Confirmation and an emailed Bid Notification.

Cancelling a Submitted Bid

Cancellations of submitted bids must be done successfully prior to the solicitation event’s ending date and time.

In the left navigation pane, click Bidding Activities to open the folder, then choose View Events and Place Bids. Click
on the link for the submitted event you would like to cancel.

sy

n

¥ ot € — 1w e [t (e et — Vil S8 oty
e wrniy

5 S ) \incie 3108 Compact T Pammger 'van Sed &y sr=unnves [ S Va8 o . ‘-
= - “ W rw Cotorn e eeurarce - i . 1 -~ .

| Serrne-id i, et L Y . St oyt

00T R L ™ Sl [ e L b

Click on View, Edit or Copy from Saved Bids.

Flauite= Main Menu ~ Manage Events and Flace Bids = My Event Acivly

COUNTY OF
SONOMA
Event Details Welcome, TE.\E
User. SCBIDDERTESTUAT100
Information On Inquiry Cplons Bidding o Lot Acl
. 1 i . ad B
Bid on Event Shortcuts: View, Edit or Copy from Saved Bids

Event Name Vehicle 2019 Compact 7 Passenger Van
Event D SC001-00000007T63
Event FormatType Sell Event RFx
Event Round 1
Event Version 1

Event Start Date 11072018 11:00AM PST
Event End Date: 02720180331 PM FST

Updated: 09/23/2020 Page 10 of 12
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Click on Cancel.

TISET. oGO Ty T T O T T

View, Edit or copy from Saved Bids

Event Name  Vehicle 2019 Compact 7 Paczenger Van
Event ID  3CDI-0000000753 Fvent Round 1
Event Format/Type  Sell Event RFx Fvent Version 1

Event Start Date 11072018 11:008M PST Multiple Bids  Aliowed

Event End Date: 22712018 (2331 PM PET Currency: US Dallar
Bids
l:‘a 1101V
Eid 1D Round Version Bid Status m Bid Last Saved
1 1 1 Submitiad Fosted D22172049 0:35AM PST View/Edit Copy

Refurn to Event Search

To cancel your previously submitted bid, click Cancel This Bid. If you do not wish to cancel, click Return to Bid
Search.

G

Cancel Bid
Business Unit SC001 Event Round 1
Event |ID 0000000763 Event Version 1
Event Name Vehicle 2019 Compacl 7 Passenger Event Format Buy
Van
BidiD 1

Bid Status Submiited
Last Saved 02/21/2019 9:35AM PST

| | Cancel This Bid |

[ Retum to Bid Search |

If you are sure you want to cancel the bid, click Yes. If you do not want to cancel, click No.

Are you sure you would like to cancel this bid? (18058,325)

Click Yes to cancel the bid.
Click No if you do not want to cancel this bid.

Updated: 09/23/2020 Page 11 of 12
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You will receive an emailed Bid Cancellation Confirmation.

Bid Cancellation Confirmation
To

Retention Policy Inbox (80 dayi)

Bid Cancellation

This message is confirming your bid cancellation for the following solicitation. See details below.

Event 1D: SC001 - 0000000763 Round 1 Version 1
Bid Number: 1

Event URL

Updated: 09/23/2020 Page 12 of 12
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